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27-VW-0-5 

Colo. Coalition 
Against Sexual 
Assault, CCASA 
Denver 

1) CCASA Member Services: Provide training, technical assistance, support and 
developmental services to system and non-system based advocates, victim service programs, 
sexual assault programs, communities and individuals. $26,520 

27-VW-0-6 

Colorado District 
Attorney's Council 
Denver 

The Ending Violence Against Women Project is a multi-disciplinary collaborative project 
that provides statewide training to criminal justice workers and community programs on 
cases involving violence against women.  The project uses law enforcement officers, 
prosecutors, victim services workers, medical providers and other specialists to train 
individuals in mostly rural areas.  The EVAW Project offers ongoing support and technical 
assistance to regional training teams and coordinated community councils. 

$106,733 

27-VW-0-24 

Colorado Coalition 
Against Domestic 
Violence 
Denver 

The CCADV Safety and Accountability Audit (DVSAA) works to improve the safety of 
domestic violence victims by working with local communities to develop a better integrated 
system-wide response to domestic violence.  In the coming grant cycle, CCADV will 
conduct three Safety & Accountability audits in rural communities to help domestic violence 
response agencies identify and build standards of practice that will enhance victim safety, 
offender accountability, and institutional accountability. 

$22,500 

27-VW-0-57 

State Court 
Administrators 
Office 
Denver 

The State Court Administrator's Office, Division of Planning and Analysis, will suggest and 
implement changes to the Protection Order Forms, conduct site visits in at least four judicial 
districts to get feedback from judges regarding the new forms, conduct training for court staff 
including staff assistants, court clerks, and judges.  Through the Division of Probation 
Services, the State Court Administrator's office will continue to provide training on domestic 
violence issues for probation staff. 

$23,805 

27-VW-0-58 

Colo. Dept. of 
Public 
Safety/Emergency 
Fund 

The Colorado Department of Public Safety/Division of Criminal Justice will administer 
emergency funds that will pay the cost of forensic sexual assault exams for those victims 
who choose not to cooperate with law enforcement or participate in the criminal justice 
system.  

$3,000 

27-VW-1-2 

District Attorney's 
Office, 1st Jud. 
Dist. 
Golden 

The District Attorney's office will continue the focus on domestic violence prosecution in 
County Court.  An experienced attorney will train prosecutors in specialized domestic 
violence prosecution, trial preparation and in assisting and supporting victims.   $49,847 
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27-VW-1-3 

Jefferson County, 
Sheriff's 
Department 
Golden 

The Jefferson County Sheriff's Office Victim Services Unit provides on-scene support, and 
follow-up services, to adult female victims of domestic violence, sexual assault, stalking and 
dating violence crime victims in unincorporated Jefferson County.   $34,393 

27-VW-1-26 

Victim Outreach 
Information, Inc. 
Golden 

Victim Outreach Information (VOI) is a law enforcement based crime victim assistance 
program that serves adult female victims of domestic violence, sexual assault, stalking and 
dating violence and child witnesses to domestic violence. The agency provides services to 
these victims in Wheat Ridge, Golden, Edgewater, Lakeside, Mountain View and the 
Colorado School of Mines.  This is a cooperative, collaborative effort between law 
enforcement based victim services, police, courts, probation and other non-profits. 

$42,000 

27-VW-1-27 

Probation 
Department, 1st 
Judicial District 
Golden 

S.T.O.P. VAWA funds are used to provide post sentence services to women who are 
impacted by the crime of Domestic Violence.  Services are initiated when the offender is 
granted probation supervised by the 1st JD and when cases are transferred to this department.  
Services are also coordinated at the Pre-sentence investigating phase upon request by the 
victim, District Attorney's Office and/or the investigating probation officer.  Services include 
VRA and non-VRA services. 

$51,286 

27-VW-1-46 
Family Tree 
Wheat Ridge 

Family Tree Domestic Violence Services requests VAWA funds for a Bilingual Legal 
Advocate staff position.  The Bilingual Legal Advocate provides legal advocacy services in 
both English and Spanish for victims of domestic violence, sexual assault and stalking. 

$20,825 

27-VW-2-1 

Project Safeguard 
Denver 

Fatality Review identifies common factors among deaths resulting from domestic violence, 
analyzes the common factors to develop lethality assessments, and shares prevention and 
intervention techniques developed from this research with law enforcement, the judiciary and 
the community.   

$16,200 

27-VW-2-4 

Colorado Nonprofit 
Development 
Center 
Denver 

The Colorado Anti-Violence Program (CAVP) provides crisis services to lesbian, bisexual, 
transgender, and queer (LBTQ) women who have been impacted by domestic and sexual 
violence.  The CAVP staff also conducts specialized training and provides technical 
assistance on LBTQ issues for other agencies and organizations to promote relevant violence 
prevention programming, reduce barriers to services, and ensure appropriate treatment of 
victims. 

$20,000 
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27-VW-2-10 

Denver Center for 
Crime Victims, The 
Denver 

The Denver Center for Crime Victims provides legal advocacy services for battered 
immigrants under the United States Violence Against Women Act.  The legal immigration 
clinic serves immigrant victims of domestic violence and sexual assault in Denver, Jefferson 
and Adams counties. 

$34,000 

27-VW-2-12 

Colorado Legal 
Services 
Denver 

This protection order project will provide attorney representation to adult female domestic 
violence and/or sexual assault victims in several Colorado counties:  Adams, Denver, El 
Paso, Pueblo, Teller, and the San Luis Valley when those victims are seeking a permanent 
protection order from the court.   

$40,000 

27-VW-2-14 

Domestic Violence 
Initiative 
Denver 

DVI will continue to provide practical and appropriate accessibility training to: justice, 
advocacy, nonprofit and community agencies and providers that are essential services for 
women with disabilities who are victims of domestic violence and/or sexual assault and seek 
to be free of violence.  Reasonable accommodations by agencies, law enforcement and 
justice systems are vital and these providers must have adequate training to effectively serve 
the victims that come in contact with DVI. 

$15,500 

27-VW-2-32 

Rape Assistance 
and Awareness 
Program (RAAP) 
Denver 

The RAAP Case Management/Victim Advocacy Program provides support and service 
coordination to victims of sexual assault throughout the 6-county Denver metro area, 
including Adams, Arapahoe, Broomfield, Denver, Douglas, and Jefferson counties by 
accompanying victims to hospital emergency rooms following an assault and in criminal 
justice settings.   

$41,032 

27-VW-2-39 

SafeHouse Denver, 
Inc. 
Denver 

SafeHouse Denver's Bilingual Services Program ensures that Spanish-speaking victims of 
domestic violence can access bilingual/bicultural services that include: shelter, advocacy, 
safety planning, education, informed resource referral, individual and group counseling and 
legal support.  The Bilingual Program effectively develops and maintains collaborative 
relationships with community organizations in order to deliver a comprehensive continuum 
of services and unduplicated programming. 

$22,835 

27-VW-2-40 

Dove: Advocacy 
Services 
Denver 

Dove provides culturally appropriate and fully accessible services for Deaf, Deaf-Blind, and 
Hard of Hearing victims of domestic violence and sexual assault by providing 24-hour crisis 
intervention, information and referral, advocacy, community education, outreach and 
interagency collaboration.   

$14,025 
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27-VW-2-42 

AMEND 
Denver 

This Multidisciplinary Domestic Violence Statewide Training Project provides trainings 
across Colorado on domestic violence, including information on: the domestic violence 
batterer as a criminal, identifying predominant aggressors, domestic violence among adults at 
risk, addictions and domestic violence, and the effects of domestic violence on victims and 
children who witness.  The target audience includes law enforcement, prosecution, probation, 
treatment providers, victim service providers, and Social Services. 

$24,359 

27-VW-2-47 

District Attorney's 
Office, 2nd Jud. 
Dist. 
Denver 

This continuation project will move forward policy development and improvements in 
Denver's criminal justice response to domestic violence.  The project continues to build 
specialized prosecution of misdemeanor cases within the District Attorney's Office as well as 
more collaborative endeavors with Denver's other criminal justice agencies and community 
partners to ensure a system response to effectively contain perpetrators, increase victim 
safety and maximize effective prosecution. 

$89,451 

27-VW-2-51 

Maria Droste 
Services of 
Colorado Inc 
Denver 

The Survivors Mental Health Program will provide mental health services, including intake 
assessment, individual therapy, medication management and crisis intervention/case 
management services, to adult survivors of violence who have serious mental illness. $10,860 

27-VW-3-9 

Advocates Against 
Domestic Assault 
Trinidad 

Advocates Against Domestic Assault provides immediate and on-going services to victims of 
domestic violence and sexual assault in the Third Judicial District consisting of Las Animas 
and Huerfano counties.  The project provides counseling, support, advocacy and safety 
planning services through our emergency shelter. 

$21,818 

27-VW-3-13 

District Attorney's 
Office, 3rd Jud. 
Dist. 
Trinidad 

Direct criminal justice services are provided to adult female victims domestic violence and 
sexual assault in the 3rd judicial district.   In addition, the project will coordinate a domestic 
violence taskforce.   $15,346 

27-VW-4-17 

Centro de la 
Familia 
Colorado Springs 

Centro de la Familia provides extensive, bilingual, culturally competent services to assist 
Hispanic/Latino adult women who are victims of domestic violence and sexual assault.  In 
addition to mental health services, the agency offers victims' advocacy; a victim's support 
group; 24-hour crisis help; court support and preparation of restraining orders; translation of 
informational, legal and clinical documents; assistance with applications for victims' 
compensation funding; & information about local laws and community resources. 

$10,000 
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27-VW-4-36 

T.E.S.S.A. 
Colorado Springs 

This project provides confidential victim advocacy services for El Paso County sexual 
assault and domestic violence victims, advocacy services to adult sexual assault survivors at 
its main office as well as at the hospital through a 24/7 hospital-based victim advocacy 
service.  TESSA will also provide domestic violence victims with assistance with temporary 
protection orders, court support, safety planning, and information and referral to community 
resources. 

$28,064 

27-VW-5-19 

Advocates of Lake 
County, Inc. 
Leadville 

The Advocates of Lake County, Inc. (ALC) provides non-emergency and 24/7 emergency 
services to include crisis intervention, shelter, food and personal items, counseling, support, 
information, referral resources, advocacy relevant to the victim's circumstances (personal, 
criminal justice, legal, medical, other as necessary), victim awareness and education, and 
community awareness and education.   

$12,000 

27-VW-5-28 
Advocates for 
Victims of Assault 
Frisco 

Continue partial funding for rent, utilities and shelter services to domestic violence victims 
and their children; new request for partial funding of legal advocate position providing 
assistance with protection orders. 

$5,000 

27-VW-6-8 

Violence 
Prevention 
Coalition of SW 
Colorado 
Durango 

This 6th Judicial District project is a collaborative multidisciplinary effort to coordinate and 
improve the systems' responses of the many agencies addressing violence against women.  
Training will be provided to law enforcement and other agencies that specifically deal with 
these crimes.  Improvement in access to services for underserved, under represented victims 
of domestic and sexual violence will be addressed through: crisis support, court advocacy, 
support for the Safehouse and Sexual Assault Nurse Examiner Program. 

$95,012 

27-VW-7-22 

Hilltop Community 
Resources, Inc. 
Grand Junction 

Satellite Office Advocate:  Serves adult female victims of domestic violence, stalking and 
sexual assault in Ouray County.  Sexual Assault Nurse Examiner Project (SANE): Provides 
forensic examinations for adult female victims of sexual assault and is available to all 
counties in the 7th Judicial District. 

$11,858 

27-VW-7-34 

Gunnison County, 
Sheriff’s 
Department 
Gunnison 

Gunnison County Law Enforcement Crime Victim Services provides direct services to adult 
female victims of domestic violence, sexual assault, stalking and dating violence reporting to 
the four law enforcement agencies in the Gunnison County area of the 7th Judicial District. $22,950 

27-VW-7-45 

District Attorney’s 
Office, 7th Jud. Dist. 
Montrose 

Continues a vertical prosecution model for sex crimes within the 7th Judicial District.  The 
DDA also prosecutes failure to register cases within the 7th Judicial District.  The prosecutor 
for sex crimes also assists in training any others that are involved in any aspect of the arrest, 
investigation and prosecution of sex offenders. 

$26,894 
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27-VW-8-30 

Crossroads 
Safehouse 
Fort Collins 

The collaboration of Alternatives to Violence in Loveland, Crossroads Safehouse in Fort 
Collins and Estes Valley Victim Advocates in Estes Park provides crisis response, victim 
advocacy and emergency shelter for adult female victims of domestic violence, sexual 
assault, and stalking.  The collaboration also conducts trainings for and attends cyclical 
meetings with law enforcement officers, and improves services for the Latina community and 
battered immigrant women. 

$37,857 

27-VW-8-50 
District Attorney’s 
Office, 8th Jud. Dist. 
Fort Collins 

The Victim/Witness Specialists provide direct criminal justice services to adult female 
victims of domestic violence, sexual assault and stalking in Larimer and Jackson counties.   $27,539 

27-VW-8-41 

SAVA Center 
Fort Collins 

The Sexual Assault Victim Advocate (SAVA) Center provides Larimer County residents 
with the only 24-hour hotline, advocacy, crisis intervention and counseling services 
dedicated exclusively to the needs of sexual assault survivors.  SAVA’s Bi-Lingual Victim 
Service Program offers culturally relevant education, outreach, and support to Spanish-
speaking community members. 

$13,000 

27-VW-9-20 
Advocate/Safehouse 
Project 
Glenwood Springs 

The project is designed to enhance and ensure the agency’s ability to provide outreach, 
counseling and education to Latinas in Garfield County regarding domestic and/or sexual 
violence and the agency’s services. 

$12,000 

27-VW-10-56 

District Attorney’s 
Office, 10th Jud. 
Dist. 
Pueblo 

The Tenth Judicial District Attorney’s Office works in conjunction with the Courts, 
Probation, law enforcement, the YWCA Domestic Violence program, and ACOVA to 
operate the Fast Track domestic violence prosecution program.   $47,802 

27-VW-11-33 
Alliance Against 
Domestic Abuse 
Salida 

This project provides emergency shelter, crisis intervention, financial assistance, individual 
peer counseling, weekly support groups, court advocacy, assistance with restraining orders, 
information and referrals to victims of domestic violence and sexual assault.   

$12,748 

27-VW-11-35 

District Attorney’s 
Office, 11th Jud. 
Dist. 
Canon City 

The 11th Judicial District’s Domestic Violence Fast Track and Monitoring program is a 
community based protocol that was designed to address victim safety, victim involvement, 
community safety and containment and accountability of domestic violence offenders.   $20,296 
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27-VW-12-7 

Alamosa County, 
Sheriff’s 
Department 
Alamosa 

The San Luis Valley Victim Response Unit provides immediate crisis intervention and 
community referrals to adult female victims of domestic violence, sexual assault, stalking 
and dating violence in the municipalities and counties of Alamosa, Saguache, Conejos, Rio 
Grande, Costilla, and Mineral.  This unit also provides training to law enforcement agencies 
throughout the 12th judicial district. 

$68,690 

27-VW-12-11 

Tu Casa, Inc. 
Alamosa 

Tu Casa offers outreach counseling and advocacy services in both English and Spanish to 
victims of domestic violence and sexual assault in the isolated, rural areas in the San Luis 
Valley.  Additionally, Tu Casa offers updated DV and SA training to law enforcement and 
other criminal justice personnel. 

$40,000 

27-VW-12-29 

San Luis Valley 
Immigrant 
Resource Center 
Alamosa 

The Por Ti Misma Program is an advocacy component of the San Luis Valley Immigrant 
Resource Center, assisting battered immigrants in applying for legal status under VAWA.  In 
addition, this program provides training/education for local service providers. $14,000 

27-VW-13-48 

SHARE, Inc. 
Fort Morgan 

This project is a multidisciplinary, collaborative approach utilizing specialized advocates for 
direct victim services to rural, underserved adult female victims of domestic violence and 
sexual assault.  Services include crisis response, translation services, coordination, referral to 
treatment, and group support.  The project will also maintain its SART project. 

$33,750 

27-VW-13-53 

Kit Carson County, 
Sheriff’s 
Department 
Burlington 

This project is a multi-agency, collaborative approach to law enforcement victim services for 
adult female victims of domestic violence, stalking and sexual assault in the Thirteenth 
Judicial District.   $28,492 

27-VW-13-49 
High Plains Sexual 
Assault Center 
Sterling 

This project is a multidisciplinary, collaborative approach to providing direct victim services 
to rural, underserved adult female victims of sexual assault.   $5,000 

27-VW-14-25 

ADVOCATES: 
Victims Assistance 
Team 
Hot Sulphur 
Springs 

This project will increase access to services for victims of domestic violence and sexual 
assault; improve collaboration among ADVOCATES, law enforcement, courts and 
prosecutors; and provide training for law enforcement officers, 14th judicial district judges, as 
well as district attorney’s office, local clergy, community service providers and medical 
personnel.    

$19,612 
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27-VW-14-31 

Advocates – Crisis 
Support Services 
Craig 

The Moffat County Violence Against Women Program is a victim-centered, multi-
disciplinary community response to sexual assault and domestic violence that includes a 
Sexual Assault Response Team (SART) that utilizes Sexual Assault Forensic Examiners 
(SAFE) as the medical component for forensic evidence collection and patient care, and a 
Latina Outreach Program to ensure accessibility. 

$22,795 

27-VW-15-15 
Domestic Safety 
Resource Center 
Lamar 

Project provides satellite offices in remote rural areas to encourage access and ensure direct 
client services to victims of domestic violence and sexual assault and their children.   $12,000 

27-VW-16-16 
Arkansas Valley 
Resource Center 
La Junta 

Satellite offices, a 24-hour crisis line and a law enforcement advocate team improve access to 
services for victims of domestic violence and sexual assault in Bent and Crowley counties.   $16,940 

27-VW-17-55 
St. Anthony Health 
Foundation 
Denver 

The St. Anthony Hospitals Sexual Assault Nurse Examiner (SANE) Program provides 
comprehensive healthcare, including forensic evidence collection and documentation, to 
adolescent and adult survivors of sexual assault.   

$38,380 

27-VW-18-43 

District Attorney’s 
Office, 18th Jud. 
Dist. 
Englewood 

This project provides direct criminal justice services to domestic violence victims involved 
with the criminal justice system at the district and county court level.   $54,982 

27-VW-19-23 

District Attorney’s 
Office, 19th Jud. 
Dist. 
Greeley 

The Domestic Violence Fast Track Program makes immediate contact with victims, provides 
referrals, discusses Victims’ Rights and gives Criminal Justice System information.   $14,972 

27-VW-19-44 
A Woman’s Place, 
Inc. 
Greeley 

This project provides victim services to victims of domestic violence in Weld County, 
including assistance with temporary protection orders, and preparation for and support 
throughout the permanent protection order process.   

$13,219 

27-VW-20-21 

MESA (Moving to 
End Sexual 
Assault) 
Boulder 

MESA's Client Services Program provides comprehensive services for sexual assault victims, 
including a 24-hour hotline, crisis intervention, advocacy, counseling, information, and 
referrals.  This project provides services to underserved victims (e.g. victims who are 
Spanish-speaking, older, disabled, and/or in the LGBTQQI community).  Additionally, this 
project focuses on systems improvement through the Sexual Assault Response Council and 
the Sexual Assault Review Team. 

$34,649 
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27-VW-20-37 
Safe Shelter of St. 
Vrain Valley 
Longmont 

The Enhanced Outreach Project improves and strengthens access to comprehensive domestic 
violence victim services for underserved populations, including monolingual Spanish-
speaking, elderly, Native American, disabled, LBT, rural and other underserved women. 

$26,162 

27-VW-20-52 

Safehouse 
Progressive 
Alliance for 
Nonviolence 
Boulder 

This project is designed to improve battered women’s access to and success within the civil 
and criminal justice system of Boulder and Broomfield Counties, ensure the availability of 
counseling and support for English and Spanish-speaking victims of domestic violence, and 
increase advocacy services to immigrant battered women. 

$7,225 

27-VW-21-38 
Western Slope 
Center for Children 
Grand Junction 

The SANE program provides compassionate, professional forensic medical 
examinations/evaluations for adult victims of sexual assault.   $13,502 

27-VW-22-18 

City of Cortez 
Cortez 

The VPC tracks all domestic violence and sexual assaults through the court system, 
coordinates trainings for the 22nd judicial district including law enforcement, Bureau of 
Indian Affairs, and area Victim Service agencies and distributes funds to RENEW, Victim 
Response Unit, and Southwest Safehouse to provide services to victims of domestic violence 
and sexual assault. 

$15,180 

27-VW-22-54 

District Attorney's 
Office, 22nd Jud. 
Dist. 
Cortez 

This project provides victims of domestic violence, sexual assault, dating violence and 
stalking with notification of all court proceedings concerning the prosecution of the case and 
with court accompaniment and referral to support services.   $16,813 

                                                                                                                                                                                           TOTAL $1,625,718 
 


